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Long ago, when life began, our species survived by reacting instantly to the threats. The ancient humans who
stopped to smell the roses became easy targets for predators. Today, the predators are mostly gone, but we
are still so primed to pay attention to bad news and tend to ignore the good things happening around us.
Sivadoss, my father belonged to this very category. He was a grumbler and kept complaining constantly
about one thing or the other. He failed to count his blessings and would rather count his problems. He was
blessed with five children, three sons and two daughters and I happen to be the eldest of them. Being his
loving daughter, I would make an all out effort to solve all his problems, whatever it be. However, father
would take the progress for granted and find a new cause for alarm. After his retirement, when he was
finding it difficult to make both ends meet, he took a drastic decision in his life. He wanted the eldest of his
three sons Sampathkumar to go abroad for a job and support him financially. When he divulged this fact to
me, I set about the task in good earnest and wished to fulfill his desire. My brother on the other hand was a
man of temper. First, he expressed his disinterest in leaving the family and second he was not willing to pay
through his nose to the international recruiting agencies as bribes to get a job. With my prayers, I succeeded
in changing his mind. Very soon, he also got a job offer in Jamaica. It was from an Indian, Narayanan,
settled in Jamaica. He did not charge any recruitment fee and was also willing to pay for his air-tickets. On
reaching Jamaica, my brother realized that he had been duped. He was not given the promised job. He had a
tiff with his boss and left the company. Suddenly he finds himself on the streets, penniless. I was gripped
with an acute feeling of guilt, for it was me, who had coaxed him to accept the job and leave the country.
Shocked beyond belief at the plight my brother had landed himself, I now felt that it was my responsibility to
bring him back to India. The letter was the only means of communication then and with less access to
phones, it took me nine long years to achieve this goal. It was at this time when I was rejoicing at the reunion
and thought that I was at last free from the guilt feelings that had been plugging me for nine long years that
the tragedy struck. I was shattered and my life will never be the same again. If only my father had not been
too ambitious or dependent on his son! If only I had not taken my father’s grumblings too seriously! If only I
had not clung to my vow of non-interference ! The guilt feelings continue. The guilt is alive. Only this time,
there is no way that I would recover…….. The book offers many lessons which are universal in nature. First,
it teaches a lesson to the over-ambitious parents who depend too much on their children for support or rather
expect too much from their children. Besides, it teaches the younger generation as to how the negative traits
like ego, pride, revenge and short temper could actually destroy your life. And last but not the least, it
teaches a lesson to the exclusive children of the world who are so naive and wish to live up to their parents'
expectations, without weighing the pros and cons and try to please them, no matter what....! The book no
doubt would stir up various emotions in the minds of the readers and make them ponder over the pointless
life and our helplessness in it.
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From reader reviews:

Mark Hart:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be upgrade about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era that is always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you
is you don't know which you should start with. This The Guilt Is Alive is our recommendation to make you
keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Samantha Flowers:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love The Guilt Is Alive, you
are able to enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hangout
type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its referred to as reading
friends.

David Waymire:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to choose
book like comic, brief story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not attempting The Guilt Is
Alive that give your fun preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading habit all over
the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world far better then how they react in the
direction of the world. It can't be said constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man or woman but
for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all of you who want to start examining as your good
habit, you may pick The Guilt Is Alive become your personal starter.

Jennifer Shipley:

This The Guilt Is Alive is great guide for you because the content that is certainly full of information for you
who always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it facts
accurately using great manage word or we can point out no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read the
item hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but
difficult core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having The Guilt Is Alive in your hand like
keeping the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no guide that offer you
world with ten or fifteen second right but this book already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hey Mr.
and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt that will?
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