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Between 1815 and 1861 thousands of planters formed a unique emigrant group in American history. A
slaveholding, landholding elite, southerners from Georgia and South Carolina uprooted themselves from
their communities and headed for their society’s borderlands with a frequency and intensity unsurpassed by
any comparable class. A phenomenon of such singularity and significance preoccupied many of the South’s
leading citizens and generated a great deal of interest and discussion among movers and prospective movers,
as well as among those who stayed behind. While many wondered what emigration could do for them as
individuals or households, others engaged in a public debate as to what emigration said about them as a class
and as a society. That multilayered debate surrounding the personal and social, spiritual and ideological
meanings of emigration is at the very center of James David Miller’s study.

In exploring what planter mobility reveals about planter identity and culture, South by Southwest blends
analysis of both public and private responses to emigration and in so doing illuminates the ways in which
elite southerners themselves understood the connections between emigration as private conduct and as a
public phenomenon. In bringing together these two spheres of inquiry, Miller examines the diverse
geographical, cultural, and intellectual meanings that elite southerners gave to their private and public
journeys and what those meanings reveal about their broader attitudes regarding the people and places of
slaveholding society.
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From reader reviews:

Ralph Dell:

The book South by Southwest: Planter Emigration and Identity in the Slave South will bring you to definitely
the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In case
you try to find new book to study, this book very suitable to you. The book South by Southwest: Planter
Emigration and Identity in the Slave South is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-
book from your official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Sarah Farmer:

Reading a book to be new life style in this year; every people loves to read a book. When you read a book
you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book
that you have read. If you would like get information about your study, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and also soon. The South
by Southwest: Planter Emigration and Identity in the Slave South provide you with new experience in
looking at a book.

Elisa Dumont:

Many people spending their time by playing outside having friends, fun activity with family or just watching
TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book. Ugh, you think
reading a book will surely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It ok you can have the e-
book, having everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like South by Southwest: Planter Emigration and
Identity in the Slave South which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.

Elizabeth Nicholson:

Many people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the actual book South by Southwest: Planter
Emigration and Identity in the Slave South to make your current reading is interesting. Your current skill of
reading proficiency is developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you
enjoy you just read it and mingle the idea about book and looking at especially. It is to be initial opinion for
you to like to wide open a book and learn it. Beside that the reserve South by Southwest: Planter Emigration
and Identity in the Slave South can to be your friend when you're experience alone and confuse with the
information must you're doing of that time.
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