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"Biblical Ambiguities" poses as its central question: when we read a passage in the Hebrew Bible, how do
we know whether the passage was meant literally or metaphorically? This study argues that our assumptions
as to how language works influences the way we interpret biblical texts. Drawing upon contemporary
linguistic theory, Aaron seeks to place before the reader a strategy for deciphering biblical idioms within a
theory of semantics, using divine imagery in the Hebrew Bible as the primary focal point. This work presents
a gradient model of meaning based on Relevance Theory and the writings of Ray Jackendoff. While
numerous biblical passages are considered in detail, the main test case for Aaron's approach to meaning and
metaphor is the Israelite attitude toward idols. Although biblical ideology is usually portrayed as contrasting
a literalist idolatry with a more sophisticated Israelite theology, Aaron argues that policies regarding icons
had less to do with theology than the politics of governance and language. Part of that critique regards
common scholarly assumptions about the literal or metaphorical character of divine imagery and idols. The
metaphorization or the literalization of biblical images has served as a reading strategy since ancient times,
and often persists in scholarly discourse today. Perhaps as important as Aaron's suggestion of an alternative
approach to the problem of distinguishing metaphorical from literal language, is that his argument raises our
consciousness of how we go about interpretive acts when writing the history of Israelite theology.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Handler:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive today, people have
do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and
notice by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. Sure, by reading a book your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay than other
is high. For yourself who want to start reading a new book, we give you this kind of Biblical Ambiguities:
Metaphor, Semantics, and Divine Imagery (Brill Reference Library of Judaism) book as beginning and daily
reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Linda Bryant:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources in it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each facts they get. How people have to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Examining a book
can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specially this Biblical Ambiguities: Metaphor,
Semantics, and Divine Imagery (Brill Reference Library of Judaism) book as this book offers you rich
information and knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no
doubt in it everbody knows.

Dennis Utley:

This Biblical Ambiguities: Metaphor, Semantics, and Divine Imagery (Brill Reference Library of Judaism) is
great guide for you because the content which is full of information for you who have always deal with
world and get to make decision every minute. This book reveal it information accurately using great manage
word or we can state no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole data
in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but tricky core information with
lovely delivering sentences. Having Biblical Ambiguities: Metaphor, Semantics, and Divine Imagery (Brill
Reference Library of Judaism) in your hand like finding the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous 1.
We can say that no publication that offer you world in ten or fifteen second right but this book already do
that. So , this is good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that?

Tanya Wilson:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many query for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people
likes looking at, not only science book but additionally novel and Biblical Ambiguities: Metaphor,
Semantics, and Divine Imagery (Brill Reference Library of Judaism) or others sources were given know-how
for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science
publication was created for teacher or students especially. Those books are helping them to increase their



knowledge. In different case, beside science publication, any other book likes Biblical Ambiguities:
Metaphor, Semantics, and Divine Imagery (Brill Reference Library of Judaism) to make your spare time
considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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