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In 1998 a troubled young man and his flamboyant mother were arrested for murdering a wealthy widow in
her New York City mansion. Suddenly, America was transfixed by a pair of real-life film noir characters, an
Oedipal team of scam artists who left a trail of blood, lies, and larceny from coast to coast. The media
couldn't get enough of the twisted relationship between Sante Kimes and her twenty-three-year-old son
Kenny.

But the most chilling story of all was never told -- until now. Kent Walker, Sante's elder son, reveals how he
survived forty years of "the Dragon Lady's" very special brand of motherly love and still managed to get
away.

As a child Kent watched his mother destroy his hardworking father, Ed Walker, and then -- with Kent's
painful collusion -- snare what Sante called "my millionaire." When she married seemingly respectable real-
estate developer Ken Kimes, it was a match made in hell.

For the next two decades Kent's mother and stepfather indulged in a globetrotting orgy of criminal behavior,
laying waste to each other and anyone who got in the way. Kent, their would-be recruit, was privvy to the
family business -- torching houses, defrauding friends, crashing White House parties, "shopping" for
trunkloads of fur coats -- and Sante's self-serving style of adultery. When Kent's half-brother, Kenny was
born, Kent was twelve years old -- old enough to know that he was his younger sibling's only protector. Kent
tried desperately to save Kenny from his mother's sinister bidding. His failure haunts him to this day.

Here, with shocking and sometimes brutal frankness, Kent explodes the romantic Hollywood image of the
grifter as antihero and exposes the truth about Sante Kimes behind the headlines. Sone of a Grifter
poignantly chronicles what it means to love somebody despite your better instincts, your worst fears, and
even your most forbidden hopes.
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From reader reviews:

Kimberly Hopkins:

Inside other case, little people like to read book Son of a Grifter: The Twisted Tale of Sante and Kenny
Kimes, the Most Notorious Con Artists in America: A Memoir by the Other Son. You can choose the best
book if you'd prefer reading a book. Given that we know about how is important the book Son of a Grifter:
The Twisted Tale of Sante and Kenny Kimes, the Most Notorious Con Artists in America: A Memoir by the
Other Son. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right,
because from book you can realize everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you
will be known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we can open
a book or searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel uninterested to go
to the library. Let's go through.

Curtis Miller:

What do you think of book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't would like do that. You must know how great and important the book Son of a Grifter: The Twisted
Tale of Sante and Kenny Kimes, the Most Notorious Con Artists in America: A Memoir by the Other Son.
All type of book is it possible to see on many sources. You can look for the internet options or other social
media.

Jose Tiernan:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try factor that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Son of a Grifter: The Twisted Tale of Sante and
Kenny Kimes, the Most Notorious Con Artists in America: A Memoir by the Other Son, it is possible to
enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can
happen its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Lisa Martin:

Within this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple method to have that.
What you need to do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to experience a look at some
books. One of many books in the top list in your reading list is actually Son of a Grifter: The Twisted Tale of
Sante and Kenny Kimes, the Most Notorious Con Artists in America: A Memoir by the Other Son. This
book which can be qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in turning into precious person. By



looking way up and review this book you can get many advantages.
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